
 

               

 

 

 
 

    
    

 
     

 
 

 
   

 
 

 
 

 
   

 
    

 
 

 
     

   
   

 
   

   
  

   
 

 
    

  
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

"Black Laws" of 1861, 1864 and 1878, March 10, 1886 

BLACK LAWS OF 1861 
Sec. 6987. A person of pure white blood, who intermarries, or has illicit carnal intercourse, with any 
negro, or person having a distinct and visible admixture of African blood, and any negro, or person 
having a distinct and visible admixture of African blood, who intermarries, or has illicit carnal 
intercourse, with any person of pure white blood, shall be fined not more than one hundred dollars, or 
imprisoned not more than three months, or both. 

SEC. 6988. A probate judge who knowingly issues a license for the solemnization of any marriage 
made penal by the last section, and every person who knowingly solemnizes any such marriage, shall 
be fined not more than one hundred dollars, or imprisoned not more than three months, or both. 

January 31, 1861. 

BLACK LAWS OF 1864 
Sec. 4. That section thirty-one of said act be so amended as to read as follows: 

Sec. 31. The township boards of education in this state, in their respective townships, and the several 
other boards of education, and the trustees, visitors and directors of schools, or other officers having 
authority in the premises, of each city or incorporated village, shall be and they are hereby authorized 
and required to establish, within their respective jurisdictions, one or more separate schools for colored 
children, when the whole number, by enumeration, exceeds twenty, and when such schools will afford 
them, as far as practicable, the advantages and privileges of a common school education; and all such 
schools so established for colored children, shall be under the control and management of the board of 
education, or other school officers who have in charge the educational interests of the other schools; 
and such schools for colored children shall be continued in operation each year until the full share of 
all the school funds of the township or district belonging to said colored children, on the basis of 
enumeration, shall have been expended: provided, that when the number of colored children residing 
in adjoining townships or districts, whether in the same or in different counties, shall exceed twenty, 
the boards of education of said townships or districts so situated, may form a joint district for the 
education of colored children, and said school shall be under the control and direction of the board of 
education of the township or district in which the school-house is situated. When the whole number of 
colored children enumerated is less than twenty, or when owing to the great distance they reside from 
each other a separate school for colored children is impracticable, the board of education shall set 
apart the full share of school funds raised on the number of said colored children, and the money so 
set apart shall be appropriated each year for the education of such colored children, under the 
direction of the board. 

March 18, 1864. 
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BLACK LAWS OF 1878 
SEC. 4008. When, in the judgment of the board, it will be for the advantage of the district to do so, it 
may organize separate schools for colored children, and boards of two or more adjoining districts may 
unite in a separate school for colored children, each board to bear its proportionate share of the 
expense of such school, according to the number of colored children from each district in the school, 
which shall be under the control of the board of education of the district in which the school house is 
situate. 

May 11, 1878. 

67th General Assembly, Regular Session.   H. B. NO. 71. 
Mr. Arnett. 
A BILL 
To repeal Secs. 4008, 6987 and 6988 of the Revised Statutes of Ohio. 

Section 1. Be it enacted by the General Assembly of the 2 State of Ohio, That sections 4008, 6987 
and 6988 of the Revised 3 Statutes of Ohio be and the same are hereby repealed. 

Section 2. That this act shall take effect and be in force 2 from and after its passage. 


